
RESOLUTION ON AUTHORITY FOR 
CAMPUS PARKING REGULATIONS PROCEDURES 

The Board of Visitors is charged with providing parking and traffic rules and regulations 
on property owned by the university, in accordance with the Code of Virginia.  Further, by 
state law, the Board of Visitors is charged with the care, preservation, and improvement 
of university property. 

Parking regulations apply to employees, students, contractors, vendors, businesses, 
visitors, and all other persons who use university owned and leased parking facilities and 
spaces.  Parking and Traffic procedures that support the regulation are administered by 
Virginia Tech Parking Services and the Virginia Tech Police Department.  These 
procedures are available on the website of Virginia Tech Parking Services and limited 
numbers of hardcopies are available upon request. 

The Vice President for Administrative Services or designee was authorized by the Board 
of Visitors in November 2012 to approve these procedures in support of the regulation. 
The university desires to authorize the Senior Vice President and Chief Business Officer 
or designee to approve changes to these procedures. 
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RESOLUTION ON AUTHORITY FOR  
CAMPUS PARKING REGULATIONS PROCEDURES 

 
 

WHEREAS, by state law, §23.1-1301, Code of Virginia, the Virginia Polytechnic Institute 
and State University Board of Visitors is charged with providing parking and traffic 
regulations on property owned, leased, maintained or controlled by the university; and  
 
WHEREAS, by state law, §23.1-2603, Code of Virginia, as amended, the Virginia 
Polytechnic Institute and State University Board of Visitors is charged with the care, 
preservation, and improvement of university property; and  
 
WHEREAS, the university has developed parking and traffic regulations applicable to 
employees, students, contractors, vendors, businesses, visitors, and all other persons 
who use university owned and leased parking facilities and spaces; and 
 
WHEREAS, the university has developed and periodically revises the Parking and Traffic 
procedures (“Parking and Traffic Operational Manual”) in support of the regulations; and 
 
WHEREAS, Virginia Tech Police Department and Virginia Tech Parking Services 
administer the Parking and Traffic Procedures; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Parking and Traffic procedures have previously been approved by the 
Vice President for Administrative Services or designee in accordance with the November 
5, 2012 Board of Visitors Resolution adopting the regulations; and 
 
WHEREAS, the university recommends that the Parking and Traffic Procedures be 
approved annually by the Senior Vice President and Chief Business Officer or designee; 
and 
 
WHEREAS, the Parking and Traffic procedures will be made available on the website of 
Virginia Tech Parking Services and provided to the Virginia Registrar of Regulations;  
  
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Visitors of Virginia Polytechnic 
Institute and State University authorizes the Senior Vice President and Chief Business 
Officer or designee to approve changes to the operating procedures in support of the 
regulations.  
 
 
RECOMMENDATION:  
 
That the resolution authorizing the Senior Vice President and Chief Business Officer or 
designee to approve changes to the Parking and Traffic operating procedures be 
adopted. 
 
November 18, 2019 
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